Wellesley High School
Wellesley MA

Furniture Bid Tally

Stefura Associates
Bid Opening: 22 September 2011

Office Monitor Creative Mega School
WB Mason Resources Equipment | Office Pavilion| RV Leonard Medical Robert H Lord Specialty Virco

A1: Task & Side Seating $209,588.35 | $191,421.99 $247,450.50 $225,030.00 | $188,873.80 no bid no bid no bid no bid

partial bid partial bid partial bid partial bid
A2: Misc Seating & Occ. Tables $ 24,594.00 nobid | $ 75,931.62 | $113,402.00 no bid nobid $ 19,389.47 nobid | $ 54,503.00
A3: Student Seating & Desks $183,401.10 no bid  $168,126.92 no bid no bid no bid no bid = $253,301.94  $185,011.34
B1: Wood & Laminate Office Furn. $174,238.99 | $167,469.62 $140,849.47 | $146,134.00 no bid no bid = $ 138,540.09 no bid no bid
B2: Metal Office Furniture $ 60,082.40 $169,588.97 $ 5,474.79 incomplete no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
C1: Student Activity & Comp. Tables || $103,279.40 nobid | $ 38,883.36 | $ 69,800.00 no bid nobid | $ 45,747.18 | $ 36,405.70 no bid
C2: Cafeteria Tables $ 55,229.00 $ 71,777.76 | $ 63,383.93 no bid no bid nobid | $ 65,229.88 ' $ 63,589.85 no bid
D1: Wood Library Furniture $ 12,120.00 nobid | $ 10,906.56 no bid no bid nobid | $ 10,271.94 no bid no bid

$ 51,866.26
D2: Metal Library Furniture $ 53,053.20 nobid | $ 49,765.86 | $ 56,274.00 no bid nobid | $ 28,602.44 no bid no bid
E1: Open Wire Shelving $ 56,173.40 nobid | $ 56,781.60 no bid no bid nobid $ 63,811.97 no bid no bid
E2: Music Furniture $ 80,733.00 nobid | $ 80,415.64 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
E3: Medical Furniture $  6,394.40 no bid nobid $ 8,446.00 nobid $ 5,926.00 nobid $ 6,005.58 no bid
partial bid

E4: Misc. Classroom Furniture $ 79,539.90 nobid | $ 41,557.92 | $ 75,110.00 no bid nobid | $ 66,923.96 $ 5929650 | $ 72,086.52

partial bid partial bid partial bid
E5: Misc. Equipment $ 56,683.75 nobid $ 55,777.02 no bid nobid $ 2,160.00 no bid no bid no bid




